
A Route:
The A Ride will be a mix of trail and road. We will start behind Tim’s on 
1st Street and take the Georgian Trail to Osler Bluff Rd.  Turn left onto 
Osler Bluff  Road (21) and then right onto Monterra Road.  Head west 
on Monterra to the top of the hill / intersection with Grey Road 19.  Turn 
left onto 19 and continue through the traffic circle onto Mountain Rd 
east.  Turn right onto Osler Bluff (19).  Continue to the short gravel 
section at the town line, then continue east on SDRD 36/37, crossing 
10th line and continuing to Highway 124.  Do the ‘jog’ across 124 and 
continue past the Lavender field to 6th Line.  Go north (left turn) onto 
6th line, turn left onto Sandford Fleming and take to the lunch site or 
back to Tim's, then lunch.   A couple of small hills and roughly 35K

Ride Leader: Jack Pady  jack@jackpadymarine.com  Cell: 705-529-1828

Sweep: Chris Meleskie  chris.meleskie@gmail.com

B Route:
The B ride will include trails and roads and is a shorter / easier ride vs 
the A ride.  This will be a mostly flat ride with a moderate pace.  It 
should be suitable for all bikes.  We will start behind Tim’s and Take the 
Georgian Trail all the way to Osler Bluff Rd, then we turn left onto Osler 
Bluff and then right onto Grand Cypress Lane, doing a loop thru 
Monterra back to Osler Bluff Rd.  Continue south (turn right) onto Osler 
Bluff Rd. and take the trail on the right just past Scandinave into 
Windfall.  Go west through Windfall across GR 19 and onto Gord 
Canning Dr. into Blue Mountain Village.  We will go through the village, 
exit onto Jozo Weider Blvd, turn right onto GR 19, left onto Monterra 
Road, and then right back onto Osler Bluff Road.  Go south to Poplar 
SDRD, turn left (east) on Poplar to 10th.  Turn left onto 10th and continue 
to the Georgian Trail.  Take the trail back to Tim’s, or to the lunch site.

The distance is approx. 28 Kms.

Ride Leader: John Kutcy

John.kutcy@gmail.com    Cell: 416-605-4741
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Sweep: Emmet Weatherhead   emmet125@sympatico.ca

 

Meeting Place and Time:

A ride: Behind Tim Horton’s on First Street in Collingwood at 9:45 am / 
departure at 10:00

B Ride: Behind Tim Horton’s on First Street in Collingwood at 9:45 am / 
departure at 10:00.

 

Lunch Venue Location:

Black Bellos - 40 Simcoe Street in Collingwood

Notify your ride leader by Sunday June 16th at 6:00 p.m. if you are 
riding and staying for Lunch
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